












approved college or university, as authorized by state laws or regulations. {Title 5 of the California Code of 
Regulations Section 3001 (r)). 

• SELPA (Special Education Local Plan Area)

• SELPA AU (Special Education Local Plan Area Administrative Unit)

• SubCONTRACTOR - any individual contracted to provide direct service to student.

• SPI (Superintendent of Public Instruction)

6. NO DISCRIMINATION

LEA and CONTRACTOR shall not, in employment or operation of its programs, unlawfully discriminate on the
basis of gender, nationality, national origin, ancestry, race, color, ethnicity, ethnic group affiliation, religion, age,
marital status, pregnancy or parental status, sex, sexual orientation, gender, gender identity or expression, physical
or mental disability, genetic information or any other classification protected by federal or state law or the
perception of one or more of such characteristics or association with a person or group with one or more of these
actual or perceived characteristics.

In the event any CONTRACTOR employee, working on a public school campus, alerts CONTRACTOR or LEA 
of a concern, CONTRACTOR and LEA shall coordinate efforts to respond and rectify any validated concerns. 

7. GOVERNING LAW

The terms and conditions of the Contract shall be governed by the laws of the State of California with venue in
Santa Clara County, California.

II. ADMINISTRATION OF MASTER CONTRACT

8. NOTICES

All notices involving 1) revocation of CONTRACTOR's certification, 2) Master Contract disputes, 3) changes of
LEA student's residence outside of current LEA attendance area, 4) termination ofISA, 5) termination of Master
Contract, 6) notification of cancellation or material change in CONTRACTOR's or LEA's insurance coverage,
and 7) LEA's reasonable objections to a subCONTRACTOR's liability insurance policy, are required to be given
to the LEA and/or CONTRACTOR in writing and may be delivered in person or by certified or registered mail,
postage prepaid or by other delivery services. Notices to LEA shall be addressed to (insert district person's name
and address)  1400 Montecito Ave Mountain View, CA 94043 

Notices to CONTRACTOR shall be addressed to CONTRACTOR's address (insert CONTRACTOR 's name and

address) William B. Doyle, Executive Director 3518 Jefferson Ave. Redwood City, CA 94062 • If mailed, notice
shall be effective as of the date of postmark on receipt by addressee. If delivered by hand, the effective date shall
be the date of receipt of addressee.

For state data reporting purposes, the Contractor will also send annual timely reports with required data elements 
to the abovementioned LEA contact 1) All incidents in which one or more statutory offenses described in 
Education Code sections 48900 and 48915 that were committed by any LEA student regardless if it results in a 
disciplinary action of in- or out-of-school suspension or expulsion and 2) All incidents resulting in the use of a 
behavioral restraint and/or seclusion even if they were not a result of a violation of Education Code sections 48900 
and 48915. 
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Frank Selvaggio  - Executive Director of Special Education






















































