,At the heart of
food and service

Sysco Northern California
SYSC0.com

May 6, 2024

Mountain View Whisman Schoo! District
Deborah M Austin

Director of Child Nutrition

1400 Montecito Ave,

Mountain View, CA 94043

Re: Rollover of RFP Mountain View Whisman Contract

Dear Deborah Austin,

Thank you for allowing Sysco San Francisco the opportunity to bid on Rollover of RFP Mountain View Whisman Contract
for the period of July 1, 2024 through June 30, 2025.

For your consideration, we've included additional varieties and cost-effective alternatives. If items on bid have guaranteed pricing that
expires before the end of bid term, the expiration date will be noted on the customer copy. New bid pricing for these items will be provided
after we have recsived the renewals from the suppliers. Notification by letter will be sent with new cost and effective dates.

Bid Pricing Overview:

o “(Asterisk) - tlems bid without a manufacturer’s price guarantee.

e Market- Items bid as Market will fluctuate weekly; however, the margin used is guaranteed through bid termn. The items identified
on the enclosed bid documents reflect the Market price on the date of document completion.

+ P -Produce items are guaranteed by calendar month. In the case of drastic weather conditions around the country we may be
forced to implement an “Act of God Clause”. In the event of this occurrence, we will provide a written notice and new pricing will
take effect immediately.

s  Ecolab- Please reach out to your local Ecolab Representative for your contract pricing on all items marked as "ECOLAB” on
your customer copy.

*  Pactiv: Due to the volaltility of the market caused by COViID-18, all Pactiv pricing is subject to change monthly with the market.

Delivery and Opening Order Overview:
»  Off Day Orders: Orders that ship outside of a normal scheduled delivery day must meet a 15 case and $750.00 minimum
order requirement. This will be waived during holiday weeks.

Please note that some items may be bid as special order. These items will require a four- week lead time to process. Any item brought in
for a customer via special order will need to ship in full to the customer within 30 days from the received date.

Should we receive notification from cur manufacturer of price changes due to the volatility in the market, where contracted pricing cannot
be extended, we will give you written notice of intent to change price. As well as documentation from the manufacturer of the intended
price change with new guaranteed dates.

To ensure pricing and accuracy, Sysco San Francisco requires at least two-week notification for pricing implementation and inventory level
adjustments. Only Sysco awarded items will be entered into our pricing system, and items not awarded Sysco may not be valid at bid price.

If you have any questions, please feel free to contact your Sysco Representative Michael McCormick or Chris Medina, Bid Manager at
510-602-8159.

Sincerely,

Chnis Medina
Chris Medina
Contract Bid Manager



California Department of Education Procurement Resources Unit
Nutrition Services Division January 2022
Form ID PRU-07b

CONTRACT EXTENSION

El CHECK HERE IF ADDITIONAL PAGES ARE ATTACHED Pages Renewal {Extension Number) Agreement Number (Base year)
1 2023-2024

1. This Extension Agreement is entered into between the School Food Authority and Contract Vendor named below:

SCHOOL FOOD AUTHORITY'S NAME
Mountain View Whisman School District

Contract Company
Sysco Food Services San Francisco

2. Base year contractterm: Effective date: 9-1-2023  Expiration date: 9-1-2024

Extension year: Effective date: 9-1-2024 Expiration date: 9-1-2025

3. The maximum dollar amount of this contract:
$450,000 (maximum dollar amount)

4. The parties mutually agree to this extension as follows. All actions noted below are by this reference made a part of
the Agreement and incorporated herein:

Contracted Vendor

CONTRACTOR'S NAME (if other than an individual, state whether a corporalion, partnership, etc.)

BY {Authorized Signature} DATE SIGNED (Do niot type)
y-s3

PRINTED NAME AND TITLE OF PERSON SIGNING

ADDRESS

SCHOOL FOOD AUTHORITY
SCHOOL FOOD AUTHORITY NAME
Mountain View Whisman School District
BY (Authorized Signature) DATE SIGNED {Do not type)

yat

PRINTED NAME AND TITLE OF PERSON SIGNING

ADDRESS




Customer Copy

Commodity Item

Bid Price wiNOI

Line # Pack Brand ftem BPescription Cust. Guar, Date Bid Price NOI Amount Discount‘ if LBS are  Special Order
available

ROLL 1 i9 66838916 (120 10Z JOMTCLS |APTZR POTSTICKER CHICKEN 56201 - 51.77 51.77

ROLL 2 2 2043388 |1 1018 |JENNIED |BACON TURKEY FULLY CKD 2701 N 40.84 40.84

ROLL 3 13 4358974 |1 1000CT |SYSCLS  |BAG PLAS 10X14 HI-DEN CLR 303679987 * 32.92 32.92

ROLL 4 4 7048934 1250 20X%24" |UPOLY BAG POLY CLR 20X24 ML 1.0 2024-10 - 20,32 20.32 | YES

ROLL 5 4 7048940 |1 1000CT |UPOLY BAG POLY T-SHIRT 15X7X26 .6 ML 15726-08 . 46,76 46.76

ROLL 6 5] 1213313 |64 3.702 |BKRSIMP_IBREAD CIABATTA SNDW 4X4 18669 * 42.08 42.08 | YES

ROLL7 23 7060420 |80 5.50Z |BUENVST JCALZONE CHEESE 3 IW WG RF 50241 * £8.60 89.60

ROLL 8 9 2370179 |1 40# CASAIMP__|CHEESE CHEDDAR MILD BLOCK YEL 263044 MARKET 2.08 2.06

ROLL 9 4 7173343 [100 75 0Z |SCHRBER |CHEESE CHEDDAR MILD SNACK 21270 MARKET 18.11 18.11

ROLL 10 8 2370203 |1 424AVG |CASAIMP__|CHEESE MONTEREY JACK BLOCK 1064 MARKET 2.04 - 2.04

ROLL 11 ) 6628804 |48 402 SYSCLS |CHICKEN BRST IFZ BNLS/SKLS ZIP 6628804 MARKET 50.02 - 50.02 | YES

ROLL 12 5 1291390 ]2 SLB TYSON CHICKEN TNDR FRTR HMSTYL SEL 11103410928 6/30/2025 30.70 - 30.70

ROLL 13 6 7799059 13 5LB SYS CLS ICHICKEN WING RSTD PCK MED 10033030895 " 60.39 - 60.39

ROLL 14 3 7161437 |64 102 POPCRNS JCHIP CORN KETTLE 893594002228 ° 38.03 - 38.03 | YES

ROLL 15 16 BB47295 |120 S0Z  |DORITOS |CHIP NACHO CHS 28400132961 ‘ 26.86 - 26.86

ROLL 16 151 6744102 |64 1.50Z |SUNCHIP JCHIP MULTIGRAIN CRIG BIG GRAB 28400444255 : 38.09 - 38.09

ROLL 17 5 6743112 |64 1.750Z |DORITOS JCHIP TORTILLA NACHO CHS L8S 28400443753 - 41.30 - 41.30

ROLL 18 33 5511928 |104 10Z DORITOS |CHIP TORTILLA NACHO CHS S8 28400111423 " 43.80 - 43.80

ROLL 18 2 1125402 |10 1LE SYSCLS |CHIP WONTON STRIP 55823 ‘ 39.39 - 39.39

ROLL 20 4 7774813 |12 8.40Z |MRTNELI |CIDER APPLE SPARKLING MARTNELI 12256 * 15.40 - 15.40

ROLL 21 12 7027999 [120 10Z DCKJANE |COOKIE SNACK FUN AND FITNESS ES1002 - 30.72 - 30.72

ROLL 22 5 1044987 |120 .88 OZ |OCKJANE |COOKIE VAN SMART ENG/SPN $C 8803 - 30.70 - 30.70

ROLL 23 2 5854377 |90 52X80N |SYS CLS |COVER PLAS BUN PAN RACK 15MC 303679973 - 2843 - 28.43

ROLL 24 2 2338596 144 S30Z JAUSTIN CRACKER CHEESE ON CHS 24/6 PK 7978392175 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ROLL 26 4 6599405 1300 .75 0Z |PEPFARM |CRACKER GOLDFISH WHL GRAIN 200140018105 N 63.90 - 63.90

ROLL 26 ] 4221644 |60 10Z PEPFARM |CRACKER GOLDFISH CHEESE 200000007495 N 20.18 - 20.18

ROLL 27 5 8026122 (300 750Z |PEPFARM |CRACKER GOLDFISH PRTZL WHLGRN 200000014396 " 51.43 - 51.43

ROLL 28 4 2093213 |150 3CT KELLOGG |CRACKER GRAHAM HNY WICALCIUM 3010091822 N 26.85 - 26.65

ROLL 28 2 9909183 [200 1.160Z |OCNSPRY |CRANBERRY DRIED RASP LMNADE 20621 N 45.99 - 45.99

ROLL 30 5 7750318 |180 3/8 OZ |COFMATE |CREAMER COFFEE NONDAIRY FR VAN 10050000350701 MARKET 15.78 - 15.78

ROLL 31 2 7038443 120 1.50Z |BELPSTY JDANISH PASTRY MINI MIX 199625420114 . 62.91 - 62.91
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Customer Copy

Commodity Item

Bid Price wiNCI

Line # Usage  SUPC Brand ltem Description Guar, Date Bid Price NOI Amaunt Discount'if LBS are Special Order
available
ROLL 32 2 7670021 |2 1GAL |KEYSTON |DELIMER DESCALER LIME AWAY RTU 6100053 * 46.87 46.87
ROLL 33 2 7159563 |4 6.75LB |KEYSTON |DETERGENT MACHINE ULTIMATE 6102318 * 108.51 108.51
ROLL 34 5 5289055 |3 2LB ECOLAB  |DETERGENT POT/PAN HAND SMARTPW 8101907 * 158.33 158.33
ROLL 35 3 5465695 |4 1 GAL |SYS REL |DRESSING ITALIAN GOLDEN 7224BSYS * 26.56 26.56
ROLL 36 4 1344033 |4 1 GAL |SYS CLS |DRESSING RANCH BTRM BANQUET 199463Y5 " 50.67 50.67
ROLL 37 2 5064183 |120 1.5 0Z |ABBTSFD |EGG PATTY SCRAM RND 3.5 CKD CF 14616-70202-00 6/30/2025 33.04 33.04
ROLL 38 2 7180346 |1 1507 |WHLFIMP |EGG SHELL MED WHT AA CA CGFREE B88356080061 MARKET 34.56 34.56
ROLL 39 18 4270963 |1 1900CT |REYNOLD |FILM PVC ROLL PERF 10X10 926 * 26.99 26.99
ROLL 40 5 2948152 |9 8CT FLD RST _|FRANK VEGETARIAN 2.7 OZ 31218 - 67.28 67.28
ROLL 41 22 7002832 |144 1.55 OZ |WELCHS |SNACK FRUIT MIXED 14498 * 53.48 53.48
ROLL 42 14 8344303 |210 10Z KEEBLER |CRACKER GRAHAM SCOOBY CINN STK 3010050689 * 52.14 52.14
ROLL 43 2 7223340 |1 LARGE |BESTVAL |GLOVE CUT RESISTHD LG DFG1000L - 20.08 20.06
ROLL 44 4 4685614 110 100 CT _|SYS CLS |GLOVE NITRILE FDSRV PF BLK LRG 304363443 - 72.69 72.69
ROLL 45 7 4685594 |10 100 CT |SYS CLS  |GLOVE NITRILE FDSRV PF BLK MED 304363442 " 72.59 72.59
ROLL 46 11 4685621 110 100 CT |8YS CLS |GLOVE NITRILE FDSRV PF BLK XL 304363444 * 72.74 72.74
ROLL 47 2 2306775 |10 100 CT |SYS CLS |GLOVE NITRILE FDSRV PF BLU LRG 304363283 - 68.67 69.67
ROLL 48 14 2306753 {10 100 CT |SYS CLS |GLOVE NITRILE FDSRV FF BLU MED 304363282 - 7047 7017
ROLL 49 3 2306781 10 100 CT |SYS CLS |GLOVE NITRILE FDSRV PF BLU XL 304363284 N 70.67 70.67
ROLL 50 20 4043948 200 502 SMUCKER {JAM STRAWBERRY CUP 5150000767 6/30/2025 18.46 18.46
ROLL 51 4 4565388 |6 #10 SYSCLS |JELLY MIXED FRUIT 173 * 91.15 91.15
ROLL 52 104 4136768 |1000 8 GM HEINZ KETCHUP PACKET FCY 10013000984802 6/30/2025 24.37 24.37
ROLL 53 10 4057410 |1 EA CAMBRO __|LID CONTAINER 284 QUART RFSCW{C2135 - 2,34 2.34
ROLL 54 3 7473477 |12 B5CT |JERTHPLS |LID PLAS CLR FLT W/SLT 12-240Z YLP24CSYS M 66.21 66.21
ROLL 55 2 6880748 (1000 17X25 |PATPCFC |LINER PAPER PAN QUILON NATL S5G01034 ‘ 73.98 73.98
ROLL 56 2 4274775 250 20-30G_|SYS CLS |LINER TRASH 30X36 .7 ML BLK HBO3IGHBS * 33.56 33.56
ROLL 57 11 3718210 200 TMEOZ |KRAFT MAYONNAISE LITE 10021000665331 613072025 18.34 18.34
ROLL 58 35 2673848 210 36 OZ |BESTFDS |MAYONNAISE LITE PACKET STICK 67544422 * 26.39 26.39
ROLL 59 19 2673855 210 37502 |BESTFDS |[MAYQONNAISE PACKET STICK 84135166 * 30.55 30,55
ROLL 60 6 3781614 |2 PAIR SUPPCLS |MITT OVEN PYROTEX BEIGE 15IN 40-1601 * 19.80 19.80
ROLL 61 28 7814647 |72 1.5 OZ |BKRSIMP |MUFFIN CORN 75759 " 25.92 25.92
ROLI. 62 12 3257955 |12 6CT BKRSCLS |MUFFIN ENGLISH PLAIN FRKSPLT 342604 * 18.27 18.27 | YES
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Customer Copy

Commodity item

Bid Price wiNGI

Line # Size Brand Item Description Cust. Guar. Date Bid Price NOI Amount Discount.if LBS are Special Craer
available

ROLL &3 1 7078320 |500 7GM__|FRENCHS |[MUSTARD YELLOW PKTS 901559255 6/30/2025 12.96 12.96

ROLL 64 4 7352388 |12 500 CT |ERTHPLS |NAPKIN DSPNSR 13X12 EARTH+ 7352388 - 46,93 48.93 | YES

ROLL 65 2 4004438 |6 2402 |LACHOY |NOODLE CHOW MEIN 4430012620 6/30/2025 38.00 38.00

ROLL 86 3 5141926 |48 2,250Z |NUTHVST |NUT MIXED 28400725989 * 90.24 90.24

ROLL 67 3 3222686 14 1GAL |SYSCLS |OIL CANOLA SAL 210802 MARKET 45.58 45.58

ROLL 68 5 5934302 |6 1GAL JAREZCLS |OIL OLIVE BLEND 80/20 650008 MARKET 92.53 92.53

ROLL 62 4 5934294 |6 1GAL JAREZCLS |OIL OLIVE BLEND 90/10 650010 MARKET 86.55 86.55

ROLL 70 1 6332845 |6 1 GAL |AREZCLS |OIL OLIVE CANOLA EVQ 75/25 850003 MARKET 129.47 129.47

ROLL 71 1 4119061 |6 1GAL _JSYSCLS |OIL VEGETABLE PURE $9504-COM MARKET 67.90 67.90

ROLL 72 4 9263211 |6 25LB |SYSIMP _ |ONION RING BEER BTR 3/8 OVNBL 41010089 : 49.25 49.25

ROLL 73 1 4583290 |6 170z |PAM PAN COATING ARSL FOOD RELEASE 6414463111 6/30/2025 23.82 23.82

ROLL 74 2 4018164 |1 101N JUNCOLN |PAN FRY ALMN/SLYST NONSTK W/HD 54010 ‘ 37.44 37.44

ROLL 75 25 0653604 {80 30Z |THE MAX |PANCAKE BLUEBERRY GLZWGN 2PCIW 9464304443 - 53.21 53.21

ROLL 76 1 7068772 |72 3.08 OZ |BUENVST |PANCAKE HTASRV STW BOWL WG IW 84040 * 60.91 60.91

ROLL 77 40 4162038 |80 302 |THE MAX |PANCAKE HT&SRY CINN 9464304442 - 53.45 5345 | YES

ROLL 78 205 7041945 |72 3.030Z |EGGO PANCAKE WHEAT CONFETTI 3800018574 6/30/2025 33.11 33.11 | YES

RCLL 79 40 2098071 |72 3.03 0Z |EGGO PANCAKE MAPLE MINIS 3800092562 - 45.86 45.86

ROLL 80 18 7967524 |2 10LE |BARILLA JPASTA RIGATONI 1000440083 - 27.86 27.86

ROLL 81 51 2400570 |48 3402 |GRDNBRG |PATTY VEG VEGGIE BURGER VEGAN 8405800055 : 61.15 61.15

ROLL 82 1 6288880 |12 280Z |CASACLS |PEPPER CHILE GRN DICED RSTD/PL 850163 ‘ 35.14 35.14

ROLL 83 5 1529587 |90 5.500Z |WLDMIKE |PIZZA PEPPERONI WHL GRAIN 51% 20210 6/30/2025 $5.40 95.40 | YES

ROLL 84 10 1555313 |4 125CT |SYSCLS |PLATE FOAM HVY LAMBLK 9 YMWOESYS 6/30/2025 35.28 3529

ROLL 85 3 7227600 |4 125 CT_|EARTHCH |PLATE PAPER FBR 8IN PFAS FREE YMCS000SPFRE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ROLL 86 3 4210985 |4 126 CT_|CHINET  |PLATE PAPER WHT VERDICT 8.75 21227 . 86.72 86.72

ROLL 87 10 3004890 |60 550Z |BELLTSY [BEAN AND CHS CHIMI NADA IW CHIMNA2W " 53.27 53.27 | YES

ROLL 88 4 1710368 |60 450Z [BELLTSY |PIZZA TURKEY NADA I.W. PIZZANADA2B12W * 51.68 51.68

ROLL 89 125 1710211 |60 4.50Z |BELLTSY [TACO POCKET TRKY NADA I'W TACONADAZB12W ‘ 57.03 57.03

ROLL 80 4 1230633 {60 70Z |SKINPOP |POPCORN PLAIN 100 CALORIE BAG 464746 * 58.60 58.60

ROLL 919 5 1757164 |2 THAVG |BHB/NPM |PORK BUTT BNLS 105300 MARKET 4.51 4.51 | YES

ROLL 92 1 1008465 |1 50LB _|IMPFRSH |POTATO BAKING IDAHO 80CT FRSH 4 P 11.26 11.26

ROLL 93 16 1998006 |6 5.8 SYSIMP__|POTATO FRY SKON COIL 1/4 SPCY 10734730409365 N 47.63 47.63
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Item Description

Customer Copy

Cust. Guar. Date

Bid Price

Commodity Item

Bid Price wiNOI
Discount if LBS are

Special Order

NO! Amount availablo
6422158 SIMPLOT _|POTATC FRY WDG SKON 8CUT SPCY 10071179478089

ROLL 95 1 3009428 |2 ioLe SYS CLS |POTATO H/BRN CKD SKLS REG CUT 34730-48578-00 P 20.57 20.57

ROLL 96 2 5021210 |12 20CT |SYSIMP__ |POTATG H/BRN PTY 2.25 02 10734730627868 * 54.42 54.42

ROLL 97 44 5021054 |6 5LB SYS IMP__ |POTATO H/BRN TRIANGLE 2 OZ 10734730627745 * 45.38 45.38

ROLL 98 5 5020906 |6 5 LB SYS IMP__ |POTATO HASHBROWN IQF LSE SHRED 10734730627354 " 41.11 41.11

ROLL 99 35 5020997 |6 5LB _ |SYSIMP__ |POTATO TATER BARREL 10734730627684 . 4149 41.49

ROLL 100 2 4669089 [48 10Z GLUTING |PRETZEL TWIST GLUTEN FREE GLO4034 NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID
ROLL 101 14 0657377 8 5CT DELREAL [TORTILLA CORN PUPUSA CHS FiC 702 NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ROLL 102 30 1766461 {48 4.20 OZ |ROSNSHR |QUESADILLA CHS RICH WHL GRAIN W31100 * 53.28 53.28

ROLL 103 4 8036964 |3 3LB AREZIMP__ |RAVIOLI CHEESE JMEBO RND PRCKD 65964 " 29.71 29.71 | YES
ROLL 104 2 9689688 |1 25LB |JDMTCLS |RICE JASMINE JM2556MP1 " 30.16 30.16

ROLL 105 39 4671368 |1 S0LB  |SYSIMP__|RICE PARBOILED PERFECT R1YK50920 ° 35.51 35.51

ROLL 108 5 5848031 |6 36 0Z |SYSIMP__ [RICE SPANISH P18Y363C1 ° 28.56 28.56

ROLL 107 23 1541889 |[120 10Z _ |SHANNON [ROLL DINNER WHL WHEAT IW $8-1355 N 31.71 3N

ROLL 108 3 7775069 |4 135 0Z |CASACLS |SALSA CHUNKY MED AUTHENTIC 48548040211 " 68.75 68.75

ROLL 109 2 6040760 |12 3LB SYSCLS |SALT KOSHER FLAKE COARSE 100012745 * 45.85 45.95

ROLL 110 2 4214649 |4 1GAL [ECOLAB _ |SANITIZER MACH LIQ ECOSAN 6113979 * 82.41 82.41

ROLL 111 10 7006331 |1 2.5GAL |ECOLAB _ |SANITIZER OASIS 1486 MULTI QUAT 6100536 * 145.88 145.88

ROLL 112 1 2267649 |4 3LB GLDLOL _ |SAUCE ALFREDO RTU 4800190656 " 43.72 43.72

ROLL 113 1 9585810 |12 7.5 0Z |MEZZETA [SAUCE HABANERO HOT 609 * 2717 2717

ROLL 114 1 4845005 |12 10 0Z |TAPATIC |SAUCE HOT 10077885882004 * 25.89 25.89

ROLL 115 1 7524051 {4 1GAL |FRANKS |SAUCE PEPPER CAYENNE RED HOT 410556011 6/30/2025 52.82 52.82

ROLL 116 1 4897641 [ 5GAL |KIKOMAN |SAUCE SOY LIGHT 130 . 46.04 46.04

ROLL 117 37 3802147 |8 5 GAL |MINOR SAUCE SWEET & SOUR RTU 50000316816USL " 57.99 57.99

ROLL 118 16 8112492 |2 1 GAL _|SYS5IMP__ JSAUCE SWEET AND SOUR 755028Y8 " 31.34 31.34

ROLL 119 1 5102736 |12 50Z TABASCO |SAUCE TABASCO HOT 28 " 35.08 35.06

ROLL 120 17 4460671 200 9 GM PPl SAUCE TACO PACKET 0 * 15.17 1517

ROLL 121 16 4232682 |6 5LB KIKOMAN _|SAUCE TERIYAKI GLAZE 4910 " 52.51 52.51

ROLL 122 39 6021372 |1 10LB 5YS CLS  |SAUSAGE TURKEY PTY CKD 1.602 801007 MARKET 41.76 41.76

ROLL 123 15 6021398 |1 10LB  JSYS CLS |SAUSAGE TURKEY SKLS LK CK .80Z 700804 MARKET 42.78 42.78

ROLL 124 1 4673687 |96 090Z |GM SNACK FRUIT SCOOBY-DOO SHAPE 11510000 " 30.07 30.07
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Customer Copy

Commodity ltem

Bid Price wiNQI

Line # Brand Item Description Cust. Guar. Date Bid Price NOI Amount Discount'if LBS are Special Order
available

ROLL 125 3 7026886 |6 3202 |TAJIN SEASONING FRUIT TAJIN 10013 * 74.41 74.41

ROLL 126 2 5432347 |1 EA MRBARBQ |SHARPENER KNIFE 90015GDCM o 6.16 6.16

ROLL 127 4 3660370 [108 1502 |NATVLY |SNACK BAR GRANOLA OATRHNY 2PK 3353000 ‘ 57.85 57.85

ROLL 128 ) 8810121 |24 10Z  |GOODHLT |SNACK CHIP VEG 526 * 25.00 25.00

ROLL 129 6 7592348 |60 1.75Z |GM SNACK MIX CHEX TROTNL FLVR 1240000 . 29.14 29.14

ROLL 130 3 6708820 |64 20Z  |MUNCHES [SNACK MIX FLAMIN HOT LSS 28400443883 * 41.30 41.30

ROLL 131 22 5073088 |104 87502 |QUAKER [SNACK MIX MUNCH MIX 28400363082 : 42.97 42.97 | YES

ROLL 132 8 2756296 |24 10Z  |HAIN SNACK VEGGIE RANCH 2 : 20.34 20.34

ROLL 133 4 3676782 |12 502 |HAIN SNACK VEGGIE STRAW SEA SALT 0 ’ 36.26 36.26

ROLL 134 1 5814421 |6 1LB MINCR SQUP BASE BEEF LO-SODIUM GF 3206 : 68.15 €8.15

ROLL 135 12 5532650 |6 1LB MINGCR SOUP BASE VEG GF NO MSG SAUT 7482603308 : 40.75 40.75

ROLL 136 1 5814397 |6 118 MINGCR SOUP BASE VGTBLE LO- SODIUM GF 5708 : 55.96 55.96

ROLL 137 4 4831901 |1 15'RL__|DAYDOTS [STRIP TEST SANITIZER QUAT-40 20304-05-11 . 16.27 16.27

ROLL 138 3 6520559 |6 5.8 SUNBUTR _|SUNFLOWER SEED SUNBUTTER SB19010 M 98.40 98.40

ROLL 139 11 1743721 |60 4.50Z |POCKET |TACO POCKET TRKY NADA WRPD TACONADAZB12W * 53.25 53.25

ROLL 140 1 8019626 100 1.50Z |FRNANDQ [TAQUITO CHICKEN SHRED 0 ' 33.84 3384 | YES

ROLL 144 1 [4984464 |1 EA SYSCO THERMOMETER DEEP FRY 200-400F 322-018-1 : 6.19 6.19

ROLL 142 11 7066308 |1 EACH |ESCALI THERMOMETER DIGITAL W/SHEATH THDGPCKT - 10.09 10.09

ROLL 143 3 7066433 |1 EACH |ESCALI THERMOMETER FREEZER / REFRIG THOLRFG * 3.66 3.66

ROLL 144 8 1954148 |2 EACH |SYSCO THERMOMETER FRZR REFR -40-80F 335-028-1 * 6.84 6.84

ROLL 145 6 1261534 |1 EA ECOLAB _|THERMOMETER OVEN DOT2 43005-01-11 : 6.34 6.34

ROLL 146 6 9907433 [12 160Z |SMPLYPE |TOFU EXTRA FIRM WTR PK NON-GMO 140549 P 17.38 17.36

ROLL 147 7 4113684 |6 #10 SYS IMP__ |TOMATO DICED IN JUICE CHNKY CA 4113684 - 29.94 29.94

ROLL 148 1 1125382 |10 1LB SYSCLS |TORTILLA STRIP TRICOLOR FRIED 55822 : 29.34 2834

ROLL 149 15 7128185 [4 125CT _|PACTIV TRAY SCHOOL FIBER 5 CMPT MC5B8000SN 6/30/2025 53.48 53.48 | YES

ROLL 150 5 2024842 [6 2.5L8 |FOSTRFM |FURKEY BREAST SLI O/RSTD FRSH 6807 MARKET 91.93 91.93 | YES

ROLL 151 2 4446813 144 S50Z |OLDWIS |TURKEY STICK SNACK GLTN FREE OL15080 NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID

ROLL 152 35 2400843 |72 4.45 OZ |DON LEE {BEEF BURGER CHS 2PK IND CBE&40 MARKET 97.36 97.36

ROLL 153 22 1475003 |12 2.8 SYSCLS |VEGETABLE BLEND JAPNSE GR A 1475003 - 4144 41.44

ROLL 154 118 7338718 |12 .750Z  |MORNSTR |VEGETABLE VEG CHICKEN NUG 2898997762 6/30/2025 49.88 49.88

ROLL 155 8 4800451 112 1.340Z |MORNSTR [VEGETARIAN PTY BRKFST SAUSAGE 2898997152 6/30/2025 50.31 50.31
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Custemer Copy

Line # P P Brand et D ptic Bid P . 5
o
ROLL 156 14 1953686 |1 200 CT_[COOPER _jWIPE ANTIBACTERIAL PROBE $150-0-8 ‘ 7.58 7.58
ROLL 157 20 1261357 |1 200CT |[ECOLAB |WIPER FDSVC F/ THERM PROBE 7700113 : 10.76 10.76
ROLL 158 5 7200826 |1 150CS |SYSCLS [WIPER TOWEL WHITE 12X24 MD DRY 3512 ' 31.92 31.92
ROLL 159 4 4252104 |150 cT SYS CLS _ |WIPER TOWEL WHITE 13.5X24 DRY 82408YS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NC BID
ROLL 160 2 4088027 |2 500 CT_[REYNOLD |WRAP FOIL CUSH-FLD 14X16 7534 * 106.05 106.05
ROLL 161 4 2599744 |1 1000CT |MCNAIRN [WRAP FOIL HAMB/CHB/FSHICHX/SPC 811161 : 154.75 154.75
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